

July 7, 2005

George M. Reiber, Esq. 3136 South Winton Road Rochester, New York 14623

Re: David G. and Mary Ann DeLano, Case No. 04-20280

Dear Mr. Reiber:

As per our prior correspondence, you have indicated that our application for payment of attorney's fees from the bankruptcy estate could be considered at the currently scheduled July 25, 2005 confirmation hearing at 3:30 p.m. at Bankruptcy Court. As you have suggested, we enclose herewith our statement for fees for the period of April 8, 2004 through the current date, with anticipated time for confirmation and continuation of the pending Cordero appeal. We have also forwarded a copy to Judge Ninfo so that the statement could be before him at the time of confirmation.

If you feel that a formal application for fees is in order, we would be happy to submit the same. However, you have indicated that it is common that such applications are considered by the Court simply as part of confirmation and have proceeded accordingly.

We look forward to the hearing on July 25th.

Very truly yours,

BOYLAN. BR CODE, VIGDOR

Christopher K. Werner

CKW/trm Enclosure

cc: Hon. John C. Ninfo, II David G. and Mary Ann DeLano

BANKRUPTCY COUR

2400 Chase Square • Rochester, New York 14604 • 585-232-5300 • FAX: 585-232-3528 60-70 South Main Street, Suite 250 • Canandaigua, New York 14424 • 585-396-0400 • FAX: 585-232-3528 http://www.boylanbrown.com

BOYLAN, BROWN, Code, Vigdor & Wilson, LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2400 Chase Square Rochester, NY 14604 June 23, 2005

David G. & Mary Ann DeLano 1262 Shoecraft Road Webster, NY 14580

Invoice# 54731 Client# 030633 Billing through 06/23/2005

030633-00001 Chapter 13

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

04/08/2004 04/14/2004	CKW CKW	Call with client; Correspondence re Cordero objection Receive and review George Reiber's letter re adjourned examination date with Cordero; Call to client; Review	0.50 1.30	hrs. hrs.
04/15/2004	CKW	Cordero motion (31 pages) and prepare notes for response Response to Corder objection	1.00	hrs.
04/16/2004	CKW	Receive and review additional motion and memo from Cordero; Revise statement in opposition; Call from Bankruptcy Court re application on submission	0.80	hrs.
04/19/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero fax to Reiber of 4/15/04	0.30	hrs.
04/22/2004	CKW	Call to client re document demands in response to 4/20 letter from George Reiber; Correspondence	0.40	hrs.
04/26/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero's letter of 4/23; Appear in Bankruptcy Court on adjournment; Review claims register	1.60	hrs.
04/28/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero reply to statement in opposition; Receive and review Cordero letter to U.S. Trustee Martini	0.50	hrs.
05/05/2004	CKW	Receive and review credit report and letters to credit card companies	0.40	hrs.
05/10/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero letter to D. Martini re list of creditors	0.20	hrs.
05/19/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero claim; Call from client re claim objection and status of creditor inquiry	0.40	hrs.
06/14/2004	CKW	Document analysis; Call to claimants; Revise trustee correspondence; Call with Dave DeLano re HSBC authorization	2.30	hrs.
06/15/2004	CKW	Call to Discover and fax document request; Call with client; Receive and response to Trustee motion to dismiss	0.30	hrs.
06/16/2004	CKW	Call re Trustee's Motion to Dismiss/Convert; Review fax to HSBC authorizing release of records	0.40	hrs.
06/18/2004	CKW	Correspondence to credit card companies for statements; Call with Mike Beyma re status of adversary proceeding	0.50	hrs.
07/02/2004	CKW	Calls to HSBC and emails to client and Trustee re copy costs; Call from Kim at HSBC	0.50	hrs.

Add:872 Att. Werner's list of 6/23/05 of services mostly for DeLanos not to produce documents to Dr. Cordero

030633 07/07/2004	DeLano, D CKW	David G. & Mary Ann Invoice# 54731 Receive and review account statements from 2 MBNA	0.50	Page 2 hrs.
07/09/2004	CKW	accounts; Copy and forward to Trustee Correspondence to Trustee and motion in opposition;	1.70	hrs.
		Calls to creditors		
07/12/2004	CKW	Complete correspondence to Reiber; Opposition to Court; Receive and review Cordero opposition to Trustee's Motion	0.80	hrs.
07/19/2004	CKW	Prepare Subpoenas for Discover, HSBC, Chase and Bank One (3 accounts); Appear on Trustee's Motion; Prepare Objection to Claim; Email to client to produce credit reports and account statements; Correspondence to Cordero and to client	4.30	hrs.
07/20/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero Order; Revise and prepare correspondence to Cordero and Court; Assemble; Call to client; Complete Objection to Claim	1.80	hrs.
07/21/2004	CKW	Call with client re document demands; Call with Mike Beyma - leave message	0.30	hrs.
08/16/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero 8/15 fax - Motion for Removal and Referral	0.20	hrs.
08/19/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero Reply to claim objection; Review and organize file and account statements obtained; Dictate response to Reply	1.50	hrs.
08/20/2004	CKW	Emails with Trustee re need to appear for 1st Meeting; Review account records	0.20	hrs.
08/23/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero Motion for sanctions; Appear on Cordero Motion to remove George Reiber; Call to HSBC re status of Subpoena response	1.80	hrs.
08/24/2004	CKW	Call with client re results of 8/23 motion	0.20	hrs.
08/25/2004	CKW	Appear in Bankruptcy Court on Cordero Claim objection; Call to report to client	2.50	hrs.
09/02/2004	CKW	Receive and review Interlocutory Order	0.30	hrs.
09/09/2004	CKW	Receive and review Chase account statements and forward same to Trustee and Cordero	0.30	hrs.
09/16/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero Motion to Second Circuit	0.30	hrs.
09/23/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero correspondence to Trustee re examination dates	0.30	
09/27/2004	CKW	Correspondence to Trustee	0.30	hrs.
09/28/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero letter to Second Circuit re discovery; Letter re exam dates	0.20	
10/14/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero discovery demands and correspondence to Reiber	0.40	
10/20/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero letter to Reiber re letter to Second Circuit	0.30	hrs.
10/21/2004	CKW	Call with Dave DeLano re discovery demand and reponse to Premier Van Liens related questions	0.20	hrs.
10/22/2004	CKW	Call with Richard Cordero; Dictate response to discovery demand of 9/29; Review discovery demand re relevance with JEM	1.50	hrs.
10/25/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero letter to Trustee Schmitt re Trustee's refusal to hold meeting	0.20	hrs.

030633	DeLano, I	David G. & Mary Ann Invoice# 54731		Page 3
10/27/2004	CKW	Receive and review DeLano fax; Complete discovery	0.30	hrs.
		response		
10/28/2004	CKW	Complete and send discovery response; Receive and review 10/27/04 letter from Cordero	0.30	hrs.
11/03/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero letter to Reiber re 341 meeting	0.30	hrs.
11/08/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero discovery motion; Dictate response	1.10	hrs.
11/09/2004	CKW	Review and revise response to Cordero motion	0.40	hrs.
11/10/2004	CKW	Receive and review Court's Interlocutory Order	0.30	hrs.
11/12/2004	CKW	Receive and review Cordero Motion to 2nd Circuit	0.30	hrs.
11/18/2004	CKW	Receive and review Reiber correspondence re retirement account; Correspondence to Trustee	0.40	hrs.
11/19/2004	CKW	Call re retirement supplement per Trustee's letter; Discuss withdrawal of Chapter 13; Status of Cordero objection	0.40	hrs.
12/15/2004	CKW	Appear in bankruptcy callendar call; Email to client; Call to client	0.90	hrs.
12/20/2004	CKW	Call with Dave DeLano re March 1 trial date; Review transactions with Cordero	0.30	hrs.
12/28/2004	CKW	Email from Trustee re 2/1 or 2/2 meeting; Email to client	0.30	hrs.
12/31/2004	CKW	Receive and review letter from Chapter 13 Trustee re adjourned 341 Hearing	0.20	hrs.
01/21/2005	CKW	Call to client re receipt of son's mobile home proceeds; Correspondence to Trustee; Discuss anticipated 341 Hearing on 2/1/05 and 3/1/05 trial	0.60	hrs.
01/24/2005	CKW	Correspondence to Trustee re sale proceeds and best interest test; Receive and review Cordero Petition for Cert.	1.10	hrs.
02/01/2005	CKW	Prepare for adjourned 341; Attend adjourned 341 with Trustee Reiber	7.20	hrs.
02/10/2005	CKW	Initial review of abstract and mortgage closing documents	0.40	hrs.
02/15/2005	CKW	Email to client re use of cash proceeds of mortgage; Correspondence to Trustee	0.40	hrs.
02/22/2005	CKW	Receive and review Cordero motion for Judge Ninfo recusal	0.40	hrs.
02/28/2005	CKW	Call to client preliminary to hearing on objection to Cordero claim	0.50	hrs.
03/01/2005	CKW	Hearing on Cordero claim objection and preparation	6.50	hrs.
03/02/2005	CKW	Repeat review of Cordero docs and claim	0.30	hrs.
03/09/2005	CKW	Receive and review March 3, 4 & 5 letters from Cordero; Correspondence to clients and Cordero; Call with client	1.30	hrs.
04/04/2005	CKW	Receive and review Cordero decision; Call to client	0.50	hrs.
04/14/2005	CKW	Email to George Reiber re confirmation hearing and fee application; Call with client	0.40	hrs.
04/22/2005	CKW	Receive and review record on appeal; Conference with DLP; Receive and review Court notices on appeal	1.00	hrs.
04/22/2005	DLP	Extended work conference and personal review of record regarding Appeal filed by Dr. Cordero.	1.30	hrs.
05/02/2005	CKW	Review statement re record on appeal of DLP	0.40	hrs.
05/02/2005	DLP	Review of file, review of Dr. Cordero's record on Appeal,	3.90	hrs.

030633	DeLano, D	David G. & Ma	ry Ann	Invoice# 54	731	Page 4
			ised and finalized o	our Record. Filed with		-
		Court.				
05/03/2005	CKW	Receive and review order		otion to reconsider and	0.40	hrs.
05/05/2005	DLP		ecord on Appeal		0.80	hrs.
05/09/2005	CKW	Receive and Cordero	review civil cover	sheet on appeal from	0.30	hrs.
05/10/2005	CKW	Call with cli	ent re: status		0.20	hrs.
05/12/2005	CKW	Receive and	review Cordero let	ter	0.20	hrs.
05/16/2005	DLP	Review of fi	lings of Dr. Corder	o on appeal.	0.50	hrs.
05/19/2005	CKW		review Motion to S sys and Diannetti let	Strike Order for brief tter	0.40	hrs.
05/20/2005	DLP	Review of fi	urther filings by Dr.	Cordero	0.40	hrs.
05/31/2005	CKW	Receive and	review Cordero let	ter to Mary Dianetti, court	0.20	hrs.
		reporter, re:	estimated cost of tra	anscript		
06/08/2005	CKW	Email from t call to client		tion dates and telephone	0.30	hrs.
06/09/2005	CKW		stee re: 7/25 confirm of loan proceeds	nation hearing and issue	0.40	hrs.
06/23/2005	CKW		nticipated) Confirm	ation hearing	1.50	hrs.
06/23/2005	CKW		Cordero appeal	Ū.	5.00	hrs.
					\$16	5,294.50
EXPENSES		5				
	Federal I	-				13.84
	Copy Ch	arges				346.32
						\$360.16
BILLING S	UMMARY					
Total profess	ional servic	es		\$16,294.50		
Total expens				\$360.16		
TOTAL NE	W CHARG	ES FOR THI	S INVOICE	\$16,654.66		
TOTAL BA	LANCE NO	OW DUE	-	\$16,654.66		
Trust accoun Trust accoun			\$6,706.66 \$6,706.66			
			<i>woyi voi voi</i>			

TRUSTEE'S FINDINGS OF FACT AND SUMMARY OF 341 HEARING

1.	Debtor	(s) DAVID G D MARY ANN				Bk.# 04-202	80	
	Attorne Plan:	ey CHRISTOPH	IER K WERI	NER, ESQ	fud	Fili	ng Fees: \$/ <i>8_</i> _	Paid
	Α.	Summary:	\$	(1940)		per_ <i></i>	<u>nth</u> by	wage order
			\$	14145	*		annually	\mathcal{R})
		Repayment to				\$ 6920	_	
		Repayment to Repayment to	•		\$464	<u>\$16,655</u>		lifia
		Repuyment t	o unoccureu	creators				nated
		Classification				ne		07 (120
		Class_		% \$				92,920 TATAI
		Class_		% \$_			[]	TATAT
		Rejection of e	executory co	ontracts	No	ne		,
dha.		Other: 🗶	Paymen	ts deci	reale	to - (13)	5 month in J	u14, 2004;
- <u>FNER</u>	1 1 1 C 0 (1 n +	Jreceiu	* (YGO) m	anth 11	Hug.	<u>ust, 200</u>	6. Plus proc	releds of
	001.1		astery	~	-tup	Think	Inner?	
	В.	Feasibility:	\	\square		1 15	mpmd	
			Indebtednes	-	\$	185466	2 'including mor	
			nly Income Estimated E		\$ <u>4886</u> \$29460		😔 (gross)\$ <u>75</u>	or. Sev
			s for Wage		\$	140.		d
			ion of Plan		$\neg \forall$	-3)	years	inormoly
	Davma	nto are not ad	anata ta av					Dave
	Fayine	nts are not ade	equate to ex	ecute plan.				
	C.	Valuation of s Interest rate u						
	•••	Amou	int of	Securi	ty			\frown
Name of Cr		Secur		Claime		Perfected	341 Valuation)isputed
Capital Aut	0ne o	^{\$} 10,3	85	¹ 98 Che Blaze	evy er	Yes	#6900 3	tip

- 3. Best interest of creditors test:
 - A. All assets were listed.
 - B. Total market value of assets:

<u>\$ 256,562</u>

4646

\$

Less valid liens Less exempt property Available for judgment liens Less priority claims (Support \$_____

C. Total available for unsecured creditors in liquidation

D. Amount to be distributed to unsecured creditors

E. Nature of major non-exempt assets: _____

4. Debtor(s) states that the plan is proposed in good faith with intent to comply with the law.

5. Debtor(s) states that to the best of his/her/their knowledge there are no circumstances that would affect the ability to make the payments under the plan.

6. (If a business) The Trustee has investigated matters before him relative to the condition of debtor's business, and has not discovered any actionable causes concerning fraud, dishonesty, incompetence, misconduct, mismanagement or irregularities in managing said business.

7.	Objections to Confirmation: Trute - disposable income - 1) I.R.A. available; 2) loan pryment available; 3) persion loan ends 1935.
8.	Debtor requests no wage order because,
_	
9.	Other comments: 1) Best Interest - \$1255. (OIL) AFIS Attorney feel Bust Christ
10.	Converted from Chapter 7 because

11. The Trustee recommends that this Plan not be confirmed.

ATTORNEY'S FEES: \$	1350		A. X
Additional fees	res \$ 15,655	(2)	GEORGE M. REIBER
Anticipated?	no		TRUSTEE

Add::938

~~ *	
IN	RE:

BK.#

Defons Dovid + MaryCan 04-20280

Ided Chapter 13 for one or more on Lost employment (Wife) lige 59 Hours or pay reduced (Hecsbord 62) To delay reterement So complete plan I/We filed Chapter 13 for one or more of the following reasons: **Medical problems** To receive a Chapter 13 discharge Filed a previous bankruptcy proceeding within six (6) years Owe priority (example: tax) claims **Reconstruct credit rating** To pay back creditors as much as possible a Zyres precor to ν To stop creditor harassment To stop foreclosure or other legal proceedings V To cram down secured liens To avoid contracts **Overextension of credit** Decline in income from business, commissions or business failure Overspending Student loans + Je woods reduced \$ 30,000 - 19,000 re-1990 ν Children's college expenses Avoid Chapter 7 substantial abuse charge **Protect debtor's property** Others:

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK IN RE:

DAVID G. & MARY ANN DELANO, Debtor(s), ORDER CONFIRMING CHAPTER 13

BK #04-20280

S.S. #xxx-xx-3894 #xxx-xx-0517

A Petition was filed by Debtor(s) under Chapter 13 of the Bankruptcy Code, and a meeting of creditors conducted upon due notice pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §341 at which the Chapter 13 Trustee, Debtor(s), and attorney for Debtor(s) were present and creditors or representatives of creditors were afforded an opportunity to be heard.

A hearing on confirmation of the Plan has been held upon due notice pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §1324. The Court has heard and determined all objections to confirmation and to Debtor's Schedules and has considered the Plan as proposed or modified, the Trustee's Report and the testimony of Debtor.

THE COURT THEREFORE FINDS:

(1) The Plan complies with the provisions of Chapter 13, Title 11, United States Code, and other applicable provisions of Title 11;

(2) The contents of the plan comply with 11 U.S.C. Section 1322 where applicable;

(3) The Plan represents the Debtor's reasonable effort and has been proposed in good faith and not by any means forbidden by law;

(4) The Plan complies with the standards required by 11 U.S.C. Section 1325 for confirmation; and

(5) Any objections to the plan have been disposed of, and there is presently pending no objection to confirmation of the instant Plan or Debtor's Schedules.

It is accordingly, ORDERED that

(1) Debtor's Plan under Chapter 13 of the Bankruptcy Code, as proposed or modified, is confirmed.

(2) Debtor is stayed and enjoined from incurring any new debts in excess of \$500.00 except such debts as may be necessary for emergency medical or hospital care without the prior approval of the Trustee or the Court unless such prior approval was impractical and therefore cannot be obtained.

(3) Except as provided by specific order of this Court, all entities are and continue to be subject to the provisions of 11 U.S.C. §362 insofar as they are stayed or enjoined from commencing or continuing any

proceeding or matter against Debtor, as the same is defined by §362, and subject to the provisions of 11 U.S.C. §1301 insofar as they are stayed or enjoined from commencing or continuing any proceeding or matter against a co-debtor, as the same is defined by §1301.

The provisions of the Plan bind the Debtor(s) and each creditor, whether or not such creditor has objected to, has accepted, or has rejected the plan.

The Debtor(s) shall forthwith and until further order of the Court pay to the Trustee in good funds the sum of \$1940.00 per month by wage order. Payments decrease to \$635.00 monthly in July, 2004; then increase to \$960.00 monthly in August, 2006 when pension loan ends; plus proceeds of mother's annuity.

(4) A fee of **\$18,005.00** is allowed the attorney for the debtor(s) herein for all services rendered in connection with this Plan, except as otherwise ordered and allowed by the Court.

(6) All of the Debtor(s) wages and property, of whatever nature and kind and wherever located, shall remain under the exclusive jurisdiction of this Court; and title to all of the debtor's property, of whatever nature and kind and wherever located is hereby vested in the debtor during pendency of these Chapter 13 proceedings pursuant to the provisions of 11 U.S.C. §1327.

(7) From the Debtor(s) funds the Trustee is directed to make payments in the following order:

a. Filing fee to the Clerk of the Court, U.S. Bankruptcy Court (if unpaid);

b. Retain at all times sufficient funds to pay all other accrued administrative expenses;

c. The unpaid balance of the above described fee to the debtor's attorney;

d. Priority payments in full as allowed by the Court, except where priority claims are deferred until payment of the secured claims;

e. Secured claims shall retain their liens as hereinafter set forth:

	SECURITY		
CREDITOR	VALUE	SECURITY	RATE
Capital One Auto	\$6,900.00	'98 Chevy	8.25%

Until the secured claim is paid in full, the secured creditor shall retain its lien. After the secured claim has been paid in full, the Debtor(s) will be entitled to an immediate lien release. Any timely and properly filed claim which alleges a security interest and is filed subsequent to the Confirmation Hearing shall be allowed as unsecured only for purposes of payment under the plan, except as may otherwise be agreed to by the Debtor(s) and the Court.

f. The balance of funds not retained for administrative expenses or used for payment of secured or priority claims shall be accumulated and distributed to unsecured creditors, as follows.

g. Classified unsecured claims as hereinafter set forth:

CREDITOR NONE AMOUNT

CLASSIFICATION

DIVIDEND

h. General unsecured creditors shall be paid **a pro rata share** of their claims as are finally determined by the Court; notwithstanding the above, the plan will not be deemed completed until the debtor(s) pay(s) three years worth of plan payments, unless allowed unsecured claims are paid in full. No claims shall be allowed unless the creditor shall file a proof of claim within 90 days of the first date set for the First Meeting of Creditors; payment to unsecured creditors as allowed by the Court will be made in monthly installments of not less than \$15.00. **Plan to run 3 years.**

i. Any temporary reduction in, or suspension of installment payments under this plan, for a period not to exceed ten (10) weeks may be granted upon application of the debtor, without notice to creditors, as the Court or Trustee deems proper.

(8) The debtor has rejected as burdensome the following executory contract(s) of the debtor:

NONE

Any claim timely and properly filed by a creditor arising from rejection of such executory contract(s) shall be allowed as if such claim had arisen before the date of the filing of the petition, subject to the right of the debtor or the Trustee to object to the amount of the claim.

(9) The following secured creditors will be paid by the debtor directly. Said secured claims are either being paid pursuant to their original contract or pursuant to new agreements reached between the parties. To the extent that any such new agreements exist, the parties are hereby ordered to execute any and all documents necessary to reflect the new notes and obligations which exist between the parties. In the event of a dismissal of the plan, the secured creditors may reinstate the terms of the original obligations, subject to the further order of this court. All parties will promptly execute any and all documents necessary to be filed. To the extent that the new arrangements reflects an extension of the obligations secured by valid liens filed prior to the filing of the petition, said liens will continue in existence as of the date of the filing of the lien, and not as of the date of the new arrangement between the parties, unless this court orders otherwise or the parties so stipulate otherwise.

<u>CREDITOR</u> Genesee Regional	<u>SECURED CLAIM</u> \$76,300.71	<u>SECURITY</u> Mortgage	BASIC TERMS Original Contract
	of this case to a case under and the Chapter 13 Trustee shate $\sqrt{2}/8$ S $\sqrt{2}/8$ S $\sqrt{2}/8$ S $\sqrt{2}/8$ AUG - 9 2005 BANKRUPTCY COURT	ll be deemed a willful fail HON. JOH	
	ROCHESTER, NY	2	

For The Western District of New York

Date: 12/7/2005

MARY ANN DELANO 1262 SHOECRAFT ROAD WEBSTER, NY 14580 Case No:04-20280

SSN #1:XXX-XX-3894 SSN #2:XXX-XX-0517 ŝ.

IN RE: DAVID G DELANO 1262 SHOECRAFT ROAD WEBSTER, NY 14580

MOTION TO ALLOW CLAIMS

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 704(5), the trustee has examined the proofs of claim filed in this case and objected to the allowance of such claims as appeared to be improper except where no purpose would have been served by such objection. After such examination and objections, if any, the trustee states that claims should be deemed allowed, or "not filed" as indicated below.

Claim #	Name and Address of Creditor	Amount	Forgive % C	Classification
001	SHERMAN ACQUISITIONS LP / D/B/A/RESURGENT CAPITAL SERVI PO BOX 10587 / GREENVILLE, SC 29603	1,991.00	87.3900%	Unsecured
002	BANK OF AMERICA / P O BOX 970 NORFOLK, VA 23501	3,335.08	87.3900%	Unsecured
003	B-FIRST, LLC / % WEINSTEIN TREIGER & RILEY, P.S. 2101 FOURTH AVE., STE. 900 / SEATTLE, WA 98121	10,203.24	87.3900%	Unsecured
004	B-FIRST, LLC / % WEINSTEIN TREIGER & RILEY, P.S. 2101 FOURTH AVE., STE. 900 / SEATTLE, WA 98121	5,317.97	87.3900%	Unsecured
005	BANK ONE / CARD MEMBER SERVICE P O BOX 15153 / WILMINGTON, DE 19886-5153	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
006	BANK ONE/FIRST USA BANK / PO BOX 517 RECOVERY DEPT / FREDERICK, MD 21705-0517	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
007	CAPITAL ONE / P O BOX 85147 RICHMOND, VA 23285	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
008	CAPITAL ONE / P O BOX 85147 RICHMOND, VA 23285	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
009	CAPITAL ONE AUTO FINANCE / P O BOX 260848 PLANO, TX 75026	6,900.00 8.2500%	From 07/25/2	Secured 2005
009	CAPITAL ONE AUTO FINANCE / P O BOX 260848 PLANO, TX 75026	3,853.28	87.3900%	Unsecured
010	CAPITAL ONE / C/O TSYS DEBT MANAGEMENT P.O. BOX 5155 / NORCROSS, GA 30091	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
011	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480	11,616.06	87.3900%	Unsecured
012	CHASE MANHATTAN BANK USA / JP MORGAN CHASE 1820 E SKY HARBOR CIRCLE SOUTH / PHOENIX, AZ 85034-9701	None	87.3900%	Not Filed .00
013	CITIBANK/CHOICE / P O BOX 6305 EXCEPTION PYMT PROCESSING / THE LAKES, NV 88901-6305	None	e 87.3900%	Not Filed .00
014	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480	2,227.57	7 87.3900%	Unsecured
015	SHERMAN ACQUISITIONS LP / D/B/A/RESURGENT CAPITAL SERV PO BOX 10587 / GREENVILLE, SC 29603	4,170.4	5 87.3900%	Unsecured
016	DISCOVER FINANCIAL SERVICES / P.O. BOX 8003 HILLIARD, OH 43026	5,755.97	7 87.3900%	Unsecured
017	DISCOVER FINANCIAL SERVICES / P.O. BOX 8003 HILLIARD, OH 43026	None	e 87.3900%	Not Filed .00
018	DR RICHARD CORDERO / 59 CRESCENT STREET BROOKLYN, NY 11208-1515	None	e 87.3900%	Unsecured
019	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480	2,137.6	4 87.3900%	Unsecured
020	GENESEE REGIONAL BANK / F/K/A LYNDON GUARANTY BANK 3380 MONROE AVE. / ROCHESTER, NY 14618			DirectPay 76,300.71
021	HSBC BANK USA / P.O. BOX 4215 BUFFALO, NY 14273-4215	9,447.8	0 87.3900%	Unsecured
022	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480	6,812.3	1 87.3900%	6 Unsecured

Trustee Reiber's list of 12/7/05 of allowed claims that forgive 87.39% of DeLanos' debt

1

United States Bankruptcy Court

For The Western District of New York

Date: 12/7/2005

IN RE: DAVID G DELANO 1262 SHOECRAFT ROAD WEBSTER, NY 14580 MARY ANN DELANO 1262 SHOECRAFT ROAD WEBSTER, NY 14580 Case No:04-20280

SSN #1:XXX-XX-3894 SSN #2:XXX-XX-0517

MOTION TO ALLOW CLAIMS

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 704(5), the trustee has examined the proofs of claim filed in this case and objected to the allowance of such claims as appeared to be improper except where no purpose would have been served by such objection. After such examination and objections, if any, the trustee states that claims should be deemed allowed, or "not filed" as indicated below.

Claim #	Name and Address of Creditor		Amount	Forgive %	Classification
023	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480		19,272.56	87.3900%	Unsecured
024	ECAST SETTLEMENT CORPORATION / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193-5480		3,931.23	87.3900%	6 Unsecured
025	CITI CARDS / PO BOX 20363 ATTN: BK DEPT / KANSAS CITY, MO 64195-0363		3,970.30	87.3900%	6 Unsecured
026	CITI CARDS / PO BOX 20363 ATTN: BK DEPT / KANSAS CITY, MO 64195-0363		None	87.3900%	6 Not Filed
027	WELLS FARGO FINANCIAL NY INC / 4137 121ST STREET URBANDALE, IA 50323		980.22	87.3900%	6 Unsecured
028	THE RAMSEY LAW FIRM / P.O. BOX 201347 ARLINGTON, TX 76006		None	87.3900%	6 Unsecured
029	GULLACE & WELD / 500 FIRST FEDERAL PLAZA ROCHESTER, NY 14614		None	87.3900%	6 Unsecured
030	BECKET AND LEE LLP / P.O. BOX 35480 NEWARK, NJ 07193		None	87.39009	6 Unsecured
		Total	101,922.68		
BOYL	STOPHER K WERNER, ESQ AN, BROWN, ET AL CHASE SQUARE		9,948.00	Debtor's	Attorney

ROCHESTER, NY 14604-0000

Your Trustee has examined the claims and recommends to the Court that they be deemed allowed for the amounts claimed, payable in the manner classified subject to the provisions of the plan and other Court orders.

WHEREFORE, the Trustee prays that the foregoing claims be allowed as set forth above.

NOTICE

/s/ George M. Reiber George M. Reiber Standing Chapter 13 Trustee

At Rochester, NY

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the above claims are allowed as recommended by the Trustee and payable as provided by the debtor's plan. The debtor and debtor's attorney of record are hereby advised that written application for modification of this notice must be made within 30 days from the date of the certificate of mailing of this notice. The motion to allow claims is deemed approved without a separate order of this Court, absent a written application for modification.

CLERK /s/ Paul R. Warren

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

/s/